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Host character list 
Expansion pack #3 

All players are optional.  all players may be expanded into teams up to 
15 duplicate players each.  2 female, 6 either, 1 male 

 

The costume suggestions are only suggestions – they can wear any costume they wish and simply wear their name tag.   

suspect name & 
occupation Suspect bio 

Suggested 
attire 

BONNIE CAPONE 
Gun Moll, Spider City Mob 

 
Optional character 

female 

Bonnie Capone is the feisty gangster of the 
Spider City Mob—an elusive underground 

operation that rules the city. Bonnie and the 
rest of the mobsters are extremely dedicated 
and loyal to their crime boss…whoever that 

may be. 
*This character may be expanded to include up 
to 15 members of the Spider City Mob (male or 

female). 

1920’s flapper, gun 
moll or gangster 

attire. Toy Tommy 
Guns as optional 

props.  

JESS BIGSBY 
Telemarketer, Sally’s Sausage 

Club 
 

Optional character 
either 

Jess Bigsby is the offensive telemarketer for 
Sally’s Sausage Club—an online sausage 

company based in Spider City.  Jess and the 
telemarketing crew are a tenacious group of 

sales professionals that refuse to accept ‘no’ as 
an answer. 

*This character may be expanded to include up 
to 15 members of the Sally’s Sausage Club 

Telemarketers (male or female). 

Business casual 
attire. Optional to 

bring sausage 
samples. 

MICKI FISH 
Children’s Television Actor 

 
Optional character 

either 

Micki Fish is the lively lead monster character 
named ‘Spunky’ on the children’s television 

show, Monster Muggies.  The cast of the show 
is a loud, boisterous group who follow the 

direction of their leader—Micki Fish. 
*This character may be expanded to include up 

to 15 members of the Monster Muggies Cast 
(male or female). 

Monster costume.  

VIC BEEBER 
Reality Television Star 

 
Optional character 

male 

Vic Beeber was declared the winner of Solo 
Survivor. He climbed many mountains, ate 

slugs to survive and braved tumultuous 
weather— but in the end, he walked away with 
1 million bucks!  Vic doesn’t get along with his 

antagonistic cast mates, but they are under 
contract to stay together for another two weeks 

for press appearances. 
*This character may be expanded to include up 
to 15 members of the Solo Survivor Cast (male 

or female). 

Costume that looks 
like you just walked 

out of the wilderness. 
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KRIS NANCE 
Cyborg Engineer 

 
Optional character 

either 

Kris Nance is the nefarious cyborg engineer 
from Cyborg Cyanetics—a company known for 

creating scandalous technology for warfare. 
Kris and his/her team of engineers are currently 

working on a top-secret project and nobody 
knows what it is…but there are rumors. 

*This character may be expanded to include up 
to 15 members of the Cyborg Engineering 

Team (male or female). 

 
 
 
 

Cyborg costume.  

STEVIE JETTS 
World Traveler 

 
Optional character 

either 

Stevie Jetts is a cheery world traveler who lives 
life to the fullest with no regrets.  A trust fund 

kid, Stevie has traveled the world and has seen 
sights most people can only dream about. 

Stevie always travels with a group of his/her 
closest friends. 

*This character may be expanded to include up 
to 15 members of Stevie’s friends (male or 

female). 

Tourist costume.  

THEO WIMBLY  
Ancient Artifact Dealer 

 
Optional character 

either 

Theo Wimbly is the shadowy ancient artifact 
dealer. Theo isn’t from Spider City, and nobody 
in town knows why s/he and his/her team have 
traveled to Spider City and purchased tickets to 

the costume party. 
*This character may be expanded to include up 
to 15 members of Theo’s colleagues (male or 

female). 

 
 

Mummy costume. 

HEATHER BANKS 
Supermodel  

Optional character 
female 

 

Heather Banks is the pampered supermodel 
and television personality. Heather travels with 
an entourage who ensures every single one of 

her needs are met and that she is safe and 
secure.  Life is difficult as a diva. 

*This character may be expanded to include up 
to 15 members of Heather’s entourage (male or 

female). 

 
Glamorous gown. 

Entourage can wear 
any type of 

bodyguard/security 
costume.  

ASH SPINX 
Amusement Park Manager 

 
Optional character 

either 

Ash Spinx is one of many managers at Dark 
Shadow Amusement Park. The management 

team at the park is a group of stern 
professionals that give no mercy when it comes 
to customers or employees breaking park rules. 
*This character may be expanded to include up 

to 15 members of Dark Shadow Managers 
(male or female). 

Witch or wizard 
costume.  

 
 


