
HOST CHARACTER LIST 
There are 5 players all are flexible gender and optional. 

NAME | 
OCCUPATION 

BRIEF BIO SUGGESTED 
ATTIRE 

GUILD 

AURO BANE 
Vice President of 

the Potions 
League, 

Charmstone 
Academy 

 
Optional player 

 

  A member of the most intelligent and hardworking group 
at Charmstone Academy, Auro Bane is a member of the 

Grimm Guild and serves as the Vice President of the 
Potions League. An 11th-year student, all Auro wants to 

do is have their nose in books to soak up as much 
information as possible. Auro is consumed with being the 
head of any class and will be the first to raise their hand 

when the professor asks a question. Auro is easily the 
most knowledgeable student at Charmstone Academy. For 

this reason, Auro is a bit socially awkward and nerdy. 
Auro has no sense of fashion or style but says it's all a 

waste of time. 

Witch or wizard 
dress robes with 
a touch of ‘nerd.’ 

As props, you 
can have some 
test tubes/flasks 
with ‘potions’ in 
them  aka: food 

coloring in water. 

 

SPRIVEN 
STONETAIL 

Member of the 
Potions League, 

Charmstone 
Academy 

 
Optional player 

 

  Spriven Stonetail is the boisterous student of the Enorim 
Guild and a member of the Potions League. A 10th-year 
student, Spriven has shown to be a bit of a troublemaker 
and not that strong of an academic. Spriven has led some 

of the underclasspersons into precarious situations and 
has recently caused some trouble for the Potions League. 
However, Spriven is charming and can talk their way out 

of anything. Spriven was a child actor and starred in 
many movies of the magical community, so it's difficult for 
Spriven to do anything sneaky without being caught, as 

everyone knows who they are!   

Witch or wizard 
dress robes and 
hat. As props, 
you can have 

some test 
tubes/flasks with 
‘potions’ in them  

aka: food 
coloring in water. 

 

SHADE SHADOW 
Member of the 
Sodarin Guild, 
Charmstone 

Academy 
 

Optional player 
 

Shade Shadow is the most likable member of the ever-
intimidating Sodarin Guild. Many people say that Shade 
was sorted into Enorim, but their parents bribed Bellatrix 

Alatar for Sodarin. This is a rumor, so it will never be 
known one way or the other.  

Shade isn't like the other Sodarins and gets along with the 
Velorians - as well as all students at Charmstone. Shade 
isn't the least bit intimidating and strives to be a standup 
comic in Magus Hollow's amateur comedy club, Laugh 

Shack, after graduation.  

Witch or wizard 
dress robes and 

hat. 
 



OMNI FORGE 
Vice President of 

the Dark Craft 
Society, 

Charmstone 
Academy 

 
Optional player 

 

  A dedicated member of the Sodarin Guild, Omni Forge 
is a 12th-year student running for the Magical 
Commissioner of Magus Hollow vacancy. The 

commissioner's office has the responsibility of budgeting 
the infrastructure of the magical community. It will be a 

great power to have for such a young mind, but with the 
Forge family connections - the election has already been 
won before the voting. Omni plans to win the election a 

month from now and start their career straight out of 
graduation from Charmstone Academy. It's rumored that 
Omni has founded a crime ring of students who wander 
the main corridor, committing petty crimes. This mobster 
mentality will not stand, but Omni is clever about never 

leaving evidence. 

Witch or wizard 
dress robes. 

 

VOLOS DAWN 
Dormitory Monitor 
of Grimm Guild, 

Charmstone 
Academy 

 
Optional player 

 

  Volos Dawn is a 12th-year student at Charmstone 
Academy and a member of the Grimm Guild. Each 

dormitory of the castle has a student assigned to monitor 
the entry and exit logs of the dorm atrium, as all access is 
logged. Volos is best pals with Jadis Westrum and would 
do anything for them - including schoolwork and chores. 
Since Jadis became the Grand Supreme Student, they 

haven't had time for anything, so Volos has taken up the 
slack.  

Volos is very loyal and dedicated to the Grimm guild and 
would do anything to protect their classmates.  

Witch or wizard 
dress robes. 

Make a badge 
with Dormitory 
Monitor as an 

optional 
accessory.  
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